



**Bay County Board of County Commissioners
Agenda Item Summary**

Seawall and Dredging Contract Award

DEPARTMENT MAKING REQUEST/NAME:

Public Works

Keith Bryant, Chief Infrastructure Officer

MEETING DATE:

April 16, 2024

REQUESTED MOTION/ACTION:

Board: a) award Contract 24-18 Eastern Shipbuilding Nelson Facility Seawall Construction and Dredging Project to RJ Gorman Marine Construction, LLC in the amount of \$11,015,500; and b) authorize the chairman to execute the contract and any contract modifications and approved by the county attorney.

AGENDA

Consent Agenda

BUDGETED ITEM?

BUDGET ACTION:

Yes

FINANCIAL IMPACT SUMMARY STATEMENT:

Project 100% funded by a FDOT JPA grant

FPID#s

44930119401/44930129401/443301239401

BACKGROUND:

On January 12, 2024 Invitation to Bid 24-18 Eastern Shipbuilding Nelson Facility Seawall Construction and Dredging Project was advertised and a pre-bid meeting was held on January 25, 2024 at 10:00 AM CST. The following responses were received and opened on March 27, at 2:00 PM CST.

Vendor	Complete Project Lump Sum	Seawall Activity Lump Sum	Dredging Activity Lump Sum	Stormwater Pond Lump Sum	Bollard Activity Lump Sum
RJ Gorman Marine Construction, LLC	\$11,015,500.00	\$7,096,875.23	\$3,028,309.68	\$218,379.17	\$671,935.92
Shoreline Foundation, Inc.	No Bid	\$7,211,890.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,012,000.00
H. G. Harders and Son, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,012,764.00
CAYO, LLC	\$13,840,425.00	\$9,498,250.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Callan Marine, LTD	No Bid	\$9,813,318.70	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,982,981.00
Ballard Marine Construction, LLC	\$15,285,310.00	\$9,916,000.00	\$3,112,310.00	\$395,000.00	\$1,862,000.00
The Dutra Group	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,950,550.00	No Bid	No Bid

Staff has evaluated the bids and RJ Gorman Marine Construction, LLC was the lowest responsible bidder

ATTACHMENTS:

Description	Type
-------------	------
